
 

 

 
Bid # 5642-2022 -Temporary Personnel Services  

Opening Date: June 10, 2021 @ 2:00p.m. EST 

 Catalyst QLM, LLC Datson360, LLC 
Lyneer Staffing 

Solutions 
Radgov, Inc. SS Solutions, LLC 

Addendum Acknowledged      
Item Position Title Pay Range Firm Markup % Firm Markup % Firm Markup % Firm Markup % Firm Markup % 

1 Office Clerk $11.84 - $19.23 132 19 27.75 38 No Bid 

2 Secretary $13.75 - $22.42 132 19 27.75 38 No Bid 

3 Executive Secretary $15.58 - $25.47 132 19 27.75 38 No Bid 

4 Account Clerk $13.75 - $22.42 132 19 27.75 38 No Bid 

5 Food Service Assistant $12.15 - $20.17 140 19 35 50 No Bid 

6 Electrician $17.68 - $28.97 143 19 29.75 50 No Bid 

7 Painter $17.68 - $28.97 143 19 29.75 50 No Bid 

8 HVAC Mechanic $17.68 - $28.97 143 19 29.75 50 No Bid 

9 Maintenance Worker/Laborer $11.84 - $19.23 143 19 29.75 50 No Bid 

10 Custodian $11.84 - $19.23 143 19 29.75 50 No Bid 

11 Classroom Behavior Assistant $17.68 - $28.97 132 19 27.75 38 22.99 

12 Activities Leader $12.15 - $20.17 132 19 27.75 38 22.99 

13 Substitute Teacher $12.00/hr. 132 19 27.75 38 22.99 
Bidders are hereby notified that failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes and Board Policy 6320.02, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the 
time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings.  Offers received from the vendors listed herein are the only offers received timely as of the above opening date and time.  All other offers 
submitted in response to this solicitation, if any, are hereby rejected as late. 
 
 

Opened By:      June Kail Date:     6/10/2021  Recorded By:    Nancy Scott Date::    6/10/2021 
 


